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COMMODITY GROUP 1 - PAPER PRODUCT / DISPENSERS 
VENDOR NEEDS TO PROVIDE FREE OF CHARGE DISPENSERS 

1-1

SEAT COVERS,TOILET, 1/2 FOLD, 250/PK; 5M/CS;  ROCHESTER #1160 4500. 
PACKAGES MUST BE GLUED, NOT STAPLED

890 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.00 26,700.00 NO BID NO BID 20.87 18,574.30 46.00 40,940.00

1-2

#SCA1616 TOILET TISSUE, ROLL, 2 PLY, 500 SHT/RL; 96 RLS/CS, UNIVERSAL 
SIZE  KIMBERLY CLARK #4460 OR EQUIVALENT. MUST BE
ON WOODEN PALLETS.

325 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 36.35 11,813.75 NO BID NO BID 27.79 9,031.75 62.50 20,312.50

1-3
JUMBO ROLL TOILET PAPER, KIMBERLY CLARK #7805 OR EQUIVALENT.

1,990 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.39 46,546.10 NO BID NO BID 17.39 34,606.10 53.65 106,763.50

1-4

2 PLY JUMBO TOILET TISSUE 1,000 FT 12/CS EQUAL TO OR BETTER THAN 
COLE AG982

2200 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.39 51,458.00 NO BID NO BID 18.59 40,898.00 32.32 71,104.00

1-5

MULTIFOLD HAND TOWEL WHITE 9.5" X 9.125" 250 TOWELS /PACKAGE 16 
PACKAGE/CS KIMBERLY CLARK #1804 OR EQUIVALENT.

440 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.87 7,862.80 NO BID NO BID 15.20 6,688.00 49.00 21,560.00

1-6

BROWN PAPER TOWELS, SINGLEFLD, 9" X 10-1/4";  12 PKG/CS;  GP
#23504.  NO SUBSTITUTES

910 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.46 16,798.60 34.00 30,940.00

1-7
JUMBO ROLL PAPER TOWELS, KIMBERLY CLARK #1040. NO SUBSTITUTES

1761 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.29 79,755.69 123.53 217,536.33

1-8
GEORGIA PACIFIC  800' 6 ROLLS /CS ENMOTION #89460 TOWELS NO 
SUBSTITUTES 165 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 63.06 10,404.90 NO BID NO BID 49.98 8,246.70 89.35 14,742.75

1-9 PAPER TOWELS:  GEORGIA/PACIFIC - 26601 - NO SUBSTITUTES 1,000 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.15 23,150.00 46.00 46,000.00

1-10 PAPER TOWELS:  LIVI, SUNYCARE, AND MOREX MULTIFOLD 1,000 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.48 20,480.00 NO BID NO BID 15.20 15,200.00 22.00 22,000.00

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 1 175,265.55 0.00 252,949.14 591,899.08

2-1

CONT #3200 OR RUBBERMAID #RUB2632 GARBAGE CAN, PLASTIC, 
WITHOUT LID, 32 GAL, 6/CTN

85 CTN

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 121.38 10,317.30 91.75 7,798.75 96.66 8,216.10 NO BID NO BID

2-2
CONTICO #730132C OR RUBBERMAID #2957 WASTE BASKET, PLASTIC, 11 
GAL, DARK BROWN, 12/CTN 115 CTN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 116.88 13,441.20 69.00 7,935.00 68.41 7,867.15 NO BID NO BID

2-3
WASTE BASKET, PLASTIC,7 GAL, BROWN, 12/CTN,  CONTICO
#730113C OR RUBBERMAID #2956 115 CTN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 62.40 7,176.00 41.00 4,715.00 44.60 5,129.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 2 30,934.50 20,448.75 21,212.25

3-1 CONTICO #292710C PLASTIC WATER BUCKET, 10 QT CAPACITY 12/CTN 50 CTN

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 124.92 6,246.00 39.00 1,950.00 38.32 1,916.00 NO BID NO BID

BID 19023 - DISTRICT WIDE CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID SUMMARY BY COMMODITY GROUP
JULY 1, 2019 - JUNE 30, 2020

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION ESTMATED 
ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT 
(UOM)

COMMODITY GROUP 2 - GARBAGE CANS / WASTE BASKETS

COMMODITY GROUP 3 - MOPS / BUCKET / HANDLES



3-2
WRINGER FOR MOP, POLYPROPYLENE PLASTIC, DOWNWARD PRESSURE, 16-
32 OZ, (USED WITH 35 QT MOP BUCKET) RUBBERMAID
#7575 NO SUBSTITUTES

33 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 95.47 3,150.51 39.50 1,303.50 49.62 1,637.46 NO BID NO BID

3-3
MOP BUCKET, 26-35 QT, (USED WITH MOP WRINGER) RUBBERMAID
#7570 33 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 64.85 2,140.05 26.50 874.50 30.85 1,018.05 NO BID NO BID

3-4
SWINGER LOOP WET MOP, 24 OZ. LG. 5" HEADBAND 12/CS; PREMIER 11703

136 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60.48 8,225.28 42.50 5,780.00 73.51 9,997.36 NO BID NO BID

3-5
SWINGER LOOP WET MOP, 32 OZ. X-LG. 5" HEADBAND12/CS; PREMIER #11704

138 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 92.04 12,701.52 49.00 6,762.00 88.94 12,273.72 NO BID NO BID

3-6
MOP HANDLE, 60" WOOD HANDLE, LARGE PLASTIC HEAD, PREMIER
#40202 OR RUBBERMAID #RUBH116 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.33 369.90 4.91 147.30 5.65 169.50 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 3 32,833.26 16,817.30 27,012.09

4-1
LOTIONIZED HAND SOAP, PH BALANCED, 12/1000 ML DISPOSABLE 
POUCHES/CS; SOFTCARE DIVERSEY #5487  NO SUBSTITUTES 380 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4-2 FOAM WASH, 1L, 6/CS  EQUIVALENT TO DEB ANTI-BAC(0307 ANT1L) 55 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.23 1,607.65 NO BID NO BID

4-3 PURELL INSTANT HAND SANITIZER FOAM - 1200 ML #5392-02 41 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 69.32 2,842.12 NO BID NO BID 48.20 1,976.20 39.00 1,599.00

4-4 PURELL INSTANT HAND SANITIZER GEL - 1200 ML #5456-04 5 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.11 305.55 NO BID NO BID 57.07 285.35 36.00 180.00

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 4 3,147.67 3,869.20 1,779.00

5-1 BLEACH, 1 GAL PLASTIC CONTAINER, 6 GAL/CS CLOROX #090101 287 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.19 3,498.53 NO BID NO BID

5-2

#020165 PUMICE STONES, 12/CS US PUMICE #JAN-12 51 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 22.32 1,138.32 NO BID NO BID 24.10 1,229.10 NO BID NO BID

5-3
ARSENAL WINDO-CLEAN+, 1/2 GAL,  6/CS HILLYARD #HIL0080222 NO 
SUBSTITUTES 67 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 112.64 7,546.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5-4
ARSENAL HEAVY DUTY FLOOR CLEANER, 1 GAL, 4/CS HILLYARD
#HIL0080906 NO SUBSTITUTES 180 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 106.24 19,123.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5-5
ARSENAL RE-JUV-NAL, HILLYARD, 1/2 GAL, 6/CS # HIL0081622 NO 
SUBSTITUTES 169 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 62.64 10,586.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5-6
ARSENAL SUPROX, 1/2 GAL, 6/CS HILLYARD #HIL0083322 NO SUBSTITUTES

7 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 92.76 649.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5-7
HILLYARD EXTRA STRENGTH CSP CLEANER, 1 GAL, 4/CS #HIL0012506
NO SUBSTITUTES 52 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 81.16 4,220.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5-8
ARSENAL SUPER SHINE ALL, 1/2 GAL 6/CS; HILLYARD #HIL0080822  NO 
SUBSTITUTES 10 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.96 1,009.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 5 44,273.80 3,498.53

COMMODITY GROUP 6 - SPRAY BOTTLE / SPRAY HEAD / SQUEEGEES

COMMODITY GROUP 5 - CLEANING AGENTS

COMMODITY GROUP 4 -SOAP, HAND SANITIZER AND DISPENSERS □VENDOR NEEDS TO PROVIDE FREE OF CHARGE DISPENSERS FOR SOFTCARE



6-1
SPRAY BOTTLE, PLASTIC, 32 OZ, WAXIE #890050C OR CONTINENTAL
#440060 695 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.53 368.35 0.40 278.00 0.47 326.65 NO BID NO BID

6-2

TRIGGER GRIP HEAD ONLY, FOR YSE WITH 32 0Z, BOTTLE, WAXIE
#890040C OR CONTINENTAL #440080

795 EA

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.46 365.70 0.35 278.25 0.53 421.35 NO BID NO BID

6-3
SQUEEGEE, WINDOW, 14" W / HANDLE,  ETTORE #2990050 OR UNGER
#GC35 51 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.56 436.56 5.25 267.75 9.61 490.11 NO BID NO BID

6-4

SQUEEGEE, WINDOW, 18" W / HANDLE, ETTORE #290070 OR UNGER
#GC45

36 EA

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.81 353.16 6.75 243.00 11.25 405.00 NO BID NO BID

6-5
SQUEEGEE, FLOOR, 36" W / HANDLE, ETTORE 291650C HANDLE
#050991 OR UNGER #FH900 12 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.66 475.92 21.49 257.88 17.76 213.12 NO BID NO BID

6-6 SQUEEGEE, WINDOW, REPLACEMENT BLADE FOR 14" UNGER #RT35 25 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.81 70.25 2.36 59.00 2.21 55.25 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 6 2,069.94 1,383.88 1,911.48

7-1 MEDIUM RUBBER GLOVES, SIZE 7, 12 PR/BX; IMPACT #43 MED 60 BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.56 1,533.60 6.00 360.00 13.50 810.00 7.00 420.00

7-2

LARGE RUBBER GLOVES, SIZE 9, 12 PR/BX; IMPACT #43 115 BOX

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.56 2,939.40 6.00 690.00 13.50 1,552.50 8.00 920.00

7-3 X-LARGE RUBBER GLOVES, SIZE 11, 12 PR/BX; IMPACT #43XL 115 BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.56 2,939.40 6.00 690.00 13.50 1,552.50 9.00 1,035.00

7-4
GLOVE, NITRILE MEDIUM PK 100, EQUIVALENT TO SKINTEK REDWOOD 
POWDER FREE MULTI-PURPOSE NITRILE GLOVES, ITEM# 4217 425 PK NO BID NO BID 3.18 1,351.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.99 2,545.75 3.48 1,479.00 3.05 1,296.25 3.40 1,445.00

7-5
GLOVE, NITRILE LARGE PK 100,  EQUIVALENT TO SKINTEK REDWOOD 
POWDER FREE MULTI-PURPOSE NITRILE GLOVES, ITEM# 4218 470 PK NO BID NO BID 3.18 1,494.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.99 2,815.30 3.48 1,635.60 3.05 1,433.50 3.40 1,598.00

7-6

GLOVE, NITRILE X LARGE PK 100,  EQUIVALENT TO SKINTEK REDWOOD 
POWDER FREE MULTI-PURPOSE NITRILE GLOVES, ITEM#4219

610 PK

NO BID NO BID 3.18 1,939.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.25 3,812.50 3.48 2,122.80 3.05 1,860.50 3.40 2,074.00

7-7

MEDIUM SIZE LATEX DISPOSABLE GLOVES IMPACT #862/M 500 BOX

NO BID NO BID 2.59 1,295.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.49 3,245.00 3.25 1,625.00 2.75 1,375.00 3.65 1,825.00

7-8 LARGE SIZE LATEX DISPOSABLE GLOVES IMPACT #862/L 820 BOX NO BID NO BID 2.59 2,123.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.75 5,535.00 3.25 2,665.00 2.75 2,255.00 3.65 2,993.00

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 7 8,204.70 25,365.95 11,267.40 12,135.25 12,310.00

8-1

FURNITURE POLISH, AEROSOL CAN, 18.5 OZ, 12 CN/CS; WAXIE # 750050 OR 
JOHNSON SUPER SHINE #J-WAX 04441

50 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 33.48 1,674.00 26.75 1,337.50 32.71 1,635.50 NO BID NO BID

8-2

SHEILA SHINE #750370 STAINLESS STEEL POLISH, 10 OZ AEROSOL CAN, 12 
CN/CS OR EQUIVALENT

56 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 82.68 4,630.08 26.75 1,498.00 39.52 2,213.12 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 8 6,304.08 2,835.50 3,848.62 0.00

COMMODITY GROUP 8 - POLISH

COMMODITY GROUP 7 - RUBBER GLOVES

COMMODITY GROUP 9 - SANITARY NAPKINS RECEPTACLES



9-1

SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL BAGS, 2-1/2" X 8"; NEC 500/CS 52 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.10 785.20 15.95 829.40 12.82 666.64 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 9 785.20 829.40 666.64

10-1 FLOOR MACHINE PAD, POLISHING  White, 20" 5/CS; 3M #4100 25 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.00 425.00 10.95 273.75 11.42 285.50 NO BID NO BID

10-2 FLOOR MACHINE PAD, POLISHING Pad Red, 20" 5/CS; 3M #5100 6 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.00 102.00 10.95 65.70 11.42 68.52 NO BID NO BID

10-3 FLOOR MACHINE PAD, CLEANING BLUE, 20" 5/CS; 3M #5300 26 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.00 442.00 10.95 284.70 11.42 296.92 NO BID NO BID

10-4
FLOOR MACHINE PAD, STRIPPING BLACK, 20" 5/CS; 3M #7200 OR 3M260150

226 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.00 3,842.00 10.95 2,474.70 11.42 2,580.92 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 10 4,811.00 3,098.85 3,231.86

11-1
BROOM, ALL CORN, FIBER, HEAVY DUTY, 15" TRIM LENGTH;  WAXIE
#0514141 OR ABCO NAT-6030 94 DOZ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 144.60 13,592.40 63.25 5,945.50 79.40 7,463.60 NO BID NO BID

11-2
LOBBY BROOM, BEST GRADE CORN BROOM; 39" OVERALL LENGTH PREMIER 
#60401 98 DOZ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 66.96 6,562.08 23.90 2,342.20 35.71 3,499.58 NO BID NO BID

11-3
BOWL MOPS, WHITE COTTON YARN WITH 12" LONG PLASTIC HANDLE; WAXIE 
#060430 OR CONTINENTAL #030220 364 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.06 385.84 0.58 211.12 0.62 225.68 NO BID NO BID

11-4
COUNTER BRUSH, 100% PURE HORSEHAIR, 14" OVERALL BLOCK, 9" BRUSH 
SURFACE, 3" TRIM;  CARLISLE #3631123 OR RM6341 30 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.51 195.30 3.85 115.50 4.23 126.90 NO BID NO BID

11-5 NYLON BRISTLE TWIST TOILET BRUSH 84 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.00 336.00 1.26 105.84 3.29 276.36 NO BID NO BID

11-6
WINDOW BRUSH, BLACK HORSEHAIR, 2-1/2" TRIM; 6/CTN; CARLISLE
#CSM1210 20 CTN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.29 285.80 52.80 1,056.00 9.33 186.60 NO BID NO BID

11-7
WAX MOP, NYLON OR RAYON BLEND, SIZE 24#  RAYON #650571 OR PREMIER 
#2342024 50 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.36 268.00 4.38 219.00 3.42 171.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 11 21,625.42 9,995.16 11,949.72

12-1
LIQUID INSECT SPRAY, FOR FLYING INSECTS, 16 OZ AEROSOL SPRAY CAN, 
12 CANS/CS; WAXIE #470051 OR KWIKILL 795127 24 OZ

25 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 48.05 1,201.25 38.75 968.75 52.02 1,300.50 NO BID NO BID

12-2
LIQUID INSECT SPRAY, FOR CRAWLING INSECTS, 20 OZ AEROSOL SPRAY 
CAN, 12 CANS/CS;  ANT & ROACH CHASE #5103 25 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 63.89 1,597.25 38.75 968.75 55.92 1,398.00 NO BID NO BID

12-3
WASP & HORNET KILLER II, 20 OZ, 12/CS, SPARTAN #6819 32 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60.46 1,934.72 41.05 1,313.60 58.32 1,866.24 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 12 4,733.22 3,251.10 4,564.74 0.00

COMMODITY GROUP 13 - MISCELLANEOUS

COMMODITY GROUP 11 - BROOMS / BRUSHES / MOPS

COMMODITY GROUP 12 - INSECTICIDES

COMMODITY GROUP 10 - FLOOR MACHINE PADS



13-1
DUST PAN LOBBY, HEAVY DUTY PLASTIC WITH SELF CLOSING COVER; 
ALUMINUM HANDLE 5-3/4" X 12" X 36-5/8";  6/PK; RUBBERMAID
#2531

96 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.59 1,688.64 6.23 598.08 7.14 685.44 NO BID NO BID

13-2

SCOURING PAD, 20 PADS/BX; 3 BX/CS;  3M #96 3M#08293 NO SUBSTITUTES 95 CS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.01 3,705.95 25.16 2,390.20 29.89 2,839.55 NO BID NO BID

13-3 SCRUBBING SPONGE, 20/CS, 3M #74 #3M08252 NO SUBSTITUTES 124 BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.06 5,463.44 29.25 3,627.00 34.52 4,280.48 NO BID NO BID

13-4 SCRUBBING SPONGE, 20/CS, 3M #63 #3M08251 NO SUBSTITUTES 55 BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 44.09 2,424.95 29.25 1,608.75 35.87 1,972.85 NO BID NO BID

13-5 TOILET PLUNGER,  6" FORCE CUP, COMPLETE; BARNETT #8318 80 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.16 652.80 3.75 300.00 3.13 250.40 NO BID NO BID

13-6

TOILET PLUNGER, BELL TYPE, 5-1/2" HEAD; 20" HANDLE, FITS ALL BATHROOM 
OR PLUMBING FIXTURES; BLACK;  WAXIE 20" WOOD
HNDL #030931

6 EA

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.29 103.74 6.50 39.00 9.57 57.42 NO BID NO BID

13-7
FEATHER DUSTER MADE OF SOFT GREY AND WHITE OSTRICH FEATHERS.  
WOOD HANDLE 15" LONG WITH 12" LONG FEATHERS; TEXAS #286Y OR 
EQUIVALENT.

26 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.93 232.18 8.50 221.00 5.57 144.82 NO BID NO BID

13-8
DOODLEBUG PAD HOLDER WITH 1 WHITE POLYESTER PAD, 1 BROWN 
STRIPPING PAD; 4 BX/CS (HANDLE NOT FURNISHED) 3M
#6472 #350310

44 BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.00 1,760.00 24.90 1,095.60 30.66 1,349.04 NO BID NO BID

13-9
DOODLEBUG PAD, BROWN STRIPPING PAD; 3M #8541 MMM8541 NO 
SUBSTITUTES 21 BOX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.81 227.01 27.53 578.13 33.14 695.94 NO BID NO BID

13-10 GUM REMOVER, AEROSOL 5 OZ CAN, 12/CS CHASE 67 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.49 2,176.83 20.50 1,373.50 23.19 1,553.73 NO BID NO BID

13-11
SCRUBS TOWELLETE 6/CS SPRAY PAINT & GRAFITTI REMOVER FOR USE ON 
WALLS, WINDOWS, SEATS, BUSES, RESTROOMS, BENCHES LOCKERS, TILE, 
BRICK, SCHOOLS, ETC. WAXIE 410240

20 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 68.89 1,377.80 62.10 1,242.00 51.70 1,034.00 NO BID NO BID

13-12 NON-SENSE AIR FRESHENER, 7 OZ CAN; 12/CS; CITRUS, #07905 25 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 37.11 927.75 26.76 669.00 31.29 782.25 NO BID NO BID

13-13
METERED AEROSOL SYSTEMS FOR NON-SENSE AIR FRESHENER; 
ROCHESTER #25165800 6 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.50 99.00 31.29 187.74 NO BID NO BID

13-14 FORWAD DC 5 GAL ENVIROBOX J&J 04543 29 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 41.70 1,209.30 33.39 968.31 NO BID NO BID

13-15 CLAIRIO GREEN EARTH FOAMING SOAP 1000ML 6/CS PROPRIETARY 250 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 46.00 11,500.00 37.65 9,412.50 NO BID NO BID

13-16 COMET POWDERED CLEANSER 21 OZ. OR EQUIVALENT 3 CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.50 97.50 32.05 96.15 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID 
COMMODITY 13

20,741.09 26,648.06 26,310.62

14-1
LINER, GARBAGE CAN, BLACK, POLYETHYLENE, 33" X 39" (32 GAL), 200/CS, 
HEAVY WEIGHT, 2 MIL, WOODLAND POLY OR TYCO OR
REPUBLIC   *ORDER QTY 26 - 50*

300 CS 31.95 9,585.00 31.48 9,444.00 26.40 7,920.00 33.96 10,188.00 36.89 11,067.00 27.76 8,328.00 27.12 8,136.00 NO BID NO BID

14-1A

LINER, GARBAGE CAN, BLACK, POLYETHYLENE, 33" X 39" (32 GAL), 200/CS, 
HEAVY WEIGHT, 2 MIL, WOODLAND POLY OR TYCO OR
REPUBLIC *ORDER QTY 51 - 100*

470 CS

31.95 15,016.50 29.82 14,015.40 26.40 12,408.00 33.34 15,669.80 35.88 16,863.60 27.76 13,047.20 27.12 12,746.40 NO BID NO BID

14-2
LINER, GARBAGE CAN, BLACK, POLYETHYLENE, 40" X 48" (40 GAL), 100/CS, 2 
MIL, WOODLAND POLY OR TYCO OR REPUBLIC *ORDER
QTY 26 - 50*

300 CS 25.38 7,614.00 23.32 6,996.00 20.20 6,060.00 25.32 7,596.00 NO BID NO BID 21.96 6,588.00 20.05 6,015.00 NO BID NO BID

COMMODITY GROUP 14 - GARBAGE CAN LINERS



14-3
LINER, HEAVY, BLACK, 1 MIL, 24" X 32", 12-16 GAL, 500/CS, WOODLAND POLY 
OR TYCO OR REPUBLIC *ORDER QTY 1 - 25* 73 CS 25.68 1,874.64 29.84 2,178.32 23.90 1,744.70 51.18 3,736.14 47.35 3,456.55 23.52 1,716.96 20.50 1,496.50 NO BID NO BID

14-3A
LINER, HEAVY, BLACK, 1 MIL, 24" X 32", 12-16 GAL, 500/CS, WOODLAND POLY 
OR TYCO OR REPUBLIC *ORDER QTY 26 - 50* 377 CS 25.68 9,681.36 28.68 10,812.36 23.90 9,010.30 34.54 13,021.58 46.06 17,364.62 23.52 8,867.04 20.50 7,728.50 NO BID NO BID

14-5
LINER, GARBAGE CAN, BLACK, POLYETHYLENE, 33" X 39" (32 GAL), 200/CS, 
HEAVY WEIGHT, 1.5 MIL, WOODLAND POLY OR TYCO OR
REPUBLIC OR POLY STAR *ORDER QTY 10 - 100*

320 CS 21.50 6,880.00 23.68 7,577.60 20.70 6,624.00 34.73 11,113.60 26.67 8,534.40 22.30 7,136.00 19.12 6,118.40 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID COMMODITY 14 50,651.50 51,023.68 43,767.00 61,325.12 57,286.17 45,683.20 42,240.80

Proposed Awards:

Total Awarded $ 442,906.67 Group 5 (P) 2-
8 44,273.80 Group 2 20448.75 Group 1 252,949.14

Group 3 16,817.30 Group 4 3869.20
Group 6 1,383.88 Group 5 (P) 1 3,498.53
Group 7 11,267.40 Group 9 666.64
Group 8 2,835.50 Group 13 (P) 1-14,16 14,810.62

Group 10 3,098.85 Group 14 42,240.80
Group 11 9,995.16 318,034.93
Group 12 3,251.10

Group 13 (P) 15 11,500.00
80,597.94

Cole Supply Hillyard JC Nelson 
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